
1 Peter 2:21 For even hereunto were ye 
called; because Christ also suffered for us, 
leaving us an example, that ye should fol-
low his steps;
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JESUS, THE EXAMPLE
New Testament

Isaiah 53:1 Who hath believed our report? 
and to whom is the arm of the Lord re-
vealed?

2 For he shall grow up before him as a ten-
der plant, and as a root out of a dry ground; 
he hath no form nor comeliness; and when 
we shall see him, there is no beauty that we 
should desire him.

3 He is despised and rejected of men; a man 
of sorrows, and acquainted with grief; and 
we hid as it were our faces from him; he 
was despised, and we esteemed him not.

4 Surely he hath borne our griefs, and car-
ried our sorrows; yet we did esteem him 
stricken, smitten of God, and afflicted.

5 But he was wounded for our transgres-
sions, he was bruised for our iniquities; the 
chastisement of our peace was upon him; 
and with his stripes we are healed.

6 All we like sheep have gone astray; we 
have turned every one to his own way; and 
the Lord hath laid on him the iniquity of 
us all.

7 He was oppressed, and he was afflicted, 
yet he opened not his mouth; he is brought 
as a lamb to the slaughter, and as a sheep 
before her shearers is dumb, so he openeth 
not his mouth.

8 He was taken from prison and from 
judgment; and who shall declare his gen-
eration? for he was cut off out of the land 
of the living; for the transgression of my 
people was he stricken.

9 And he made his grave with the wicked, 
and with the rich in his death; because he 
had done no violence, neither was any de-
ceit in his mouth.

10 Yet it pleased the Lord to bruise him; 
he hath put him to grief; when thou shalt 
make his soul an offering for sin, he shall 
see his seed, he shall prolong his days, and 
the pleasure of the Lord shall prosper in 
his hand.

11 He shall see of the travail of his soul, 
and shall be satisfied; by his knowledge 
shall my righteous servant justify many; 
for he shall bear their iniquities.

12 Therefore will I divide him a portion 
with the great, and he shall divide the spoil 
with the strong; because he hath poured 
out his soul unto death; and he was num-
bered with the transgressors; and he bare 
the sin of many, and made intercession for 
the transgressors.

Old Testament

3 Nephi 8:39 And when the disciples had 
done this, Jesus said unto them, Blessed 
are ye for this thing which ye have done, 
for this is fulfilling my commandments, 
and this doth witness unto the Father that 
ye are willing to do that which I have com-
manded you.

40 And this shall ye always do unto those 
who repent and are baptized in my name; 
and ye shall do it in remembrance of my 
blood, which I have shed for you, that ye 
may witness unto the Father that ye do al-
ways remember me.

41 And if ye do always remember me, ye 
shall have my Spirit to be with you.

42 And I give unto you a commandment 
that ye shall do these things.

43 And if ye shall always do these things, 
blessed are ye, for ye are built upon my 
rock.

44 But whoso among you shall do more or 
less than these, are not built upon my rock, 
but are built upon a sandy foundation;

45 And when the rain descends, and the 
floods come, and the winds blow, and beat 
upon them, they shall fall, and the gates of 
hell are already open to receive them:

46 Therefore blessed are ye if ye shall keep 
my commandments, which the Father 
hath commanded me that I should give 
unto you.

47 Verily, verily, I say unto you, Ye must 
watch and pray always, lest ye be tempted 
by the devil, and ye are led away captive by 
him.

48 And as I have prayed among you, even 
so shall ye pray in my church, among my 
people who do repent and are baptized in 
my name.

49 Behold I am the light; I have set an ex-
ample for you.

Book of Mormon

D&C DC 38:5a But verily I say unto you, 
that, in time, ye shall have no king nor rul-
er, for I will be your king and watch over 
you.

5b Wherefore, hear my voice and follow 
me, and you shall be a free people, and 
ye shall have no laws but my laws, when I 
come, for I am your lawgiver, and what can 
stay my hand?
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